Entering A Bid On-line Using the City of Boston Supplier Portal

1.
‘Event Name’ link.

Favgrites - Main Menu

Personalize Content | Layout

Once logged into the Portal locate the bid you are interested in from the ‘Events’ list and click on the

Add to Favorites

Home

|Top Menu Features Description [=

Our menu has changed!

The menu is now located across the top of the
page. Click on Main Menu to get started

Highlights

Recently Used pages
now appear under the
Favorites menu, located
at the top left

Breadcrumbs visually
display your navigation
path and give you
access to the contents
of subfolders.

Menu Search, located
under the Main Menu,
howe supports type
ahead which makes
finding pages much
faster.

Mty Sell Events

Event ID

EVO0002726
Ev00002684
Ev00002784
EvO0002785
Ev00002802
Ev00002304
Ev00002807
Ev00002308
Ev00002809
Ev00002315
EVO0002816
Ev00002817

Ev0000SS BF D BUNKER GEAR

Ev00002823
Ev00002325
Ev00002830

See all Events

Event Hame

Cloud-Based CRM Wark Flow Managerment Solution
Enterprise Energy Management Systern (EEME)

201 5=Later 3/4Ton Cab & Chassis Utility Body Truck

(23 2016 or Later 12 Passenner Yans BTD

Saffit Repair at Faneuil Hall
2016 RWD Yan - (BFD,

Rack Body Senrice Truck- BFD
Ford Explorers (4) BFD

2016 Mid Size Sedan (HFD:

Remaoval of ashestos pipe insulation
2016 F-250 3/4 Ton Pick-Up Truck (MOEM) Per Spec

Rim & Lire Boroir or Peplacement

Mediurn Duty Cab & Chassis witiheel Lit- BTD
Headsets
Doitettuke License

Start Date Time
12/09/2015 9:00AM EST
11/09/2015 12:00PM EST
1201472015 2:00AM EST
121472015
121672015
1272172015
1212172015

9:00AM EST
F3IPMEST
S:01AM EST
9:00AM EST
12031/2015 9:004M EST
1272102018 9:00AM EST
120212015 12:00FM EST
1228/2018 F:01AM EST
1202102015 12:00PM EST
12/28/2018 9:00AM EST
12/28/2015 2:01AM EST
12024/2015 3:00AM EST

1212802015 3:30PM EST

=l

End Date/ Time: Event Statu
O1A1 52016 12:00 PM Posted
01/08¢2016 12:00 PM Posted

1ht, 43mins, 35 secs Posted

1hr, 43mins, 33 secs Posted

Shrs, 16 mins, 50 secs Posted
O1/062016 12:00 PM Posted
0170872016 12:00 PM Posted
01/082016 12:00 PM Posted
0170272016 12:00 PM Posted
O1/062016 12:00 PM Posted
O1A1 52016 12:00 PM Posted
O1A 102016 11:00 A Posted
017122016 12:00 PM Posted
O1A 52016 12:00 PM Posted

4 hrs, 43mins, 35 secs Posted

Shrs, 13 mins, 33 secs Posted

2. The ‘Event Details’ page will display. This is a view only page. You cannot enter any bid response
information yet. You can access any attachments the event creator has made available to bidders by

clicking the ‘View Event Package’ link located to the right of the ‘Bidding Shortcuts’ area.

Favorites . Main Menu

Event Details

Welcome, Paul McCormack Inc

User: PaulMcCormack

Information On Inquiry Options

Bidding Shortcuts:

View Event Activi

Accept Invitation
Bid on Event

Event Name: BFD BUNKER GEAR
EventID: BOSTN-EV00002822
Event Format/Type: Sell Event RFx
Event Round: 1
Event Version: 1
Event Start Date: 12/28/2015 9.00AM EST

Event End Date:

01/12/2016 12:00 PM EST

Event Description:

BUNKER GEAR-STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING GEAR; JACKETS, PANTS per specification OR

Contact: Lamberti, Arlene
Phone: 617 6353705
Email:

Online Discussion:
Live Chat Help:

Arlene.Lamberti@boston.gov

APPROVED EQUAL

Payment Terms: Met 30

My Bids: 0

Edits to Submitted Bids: Allowed
Multiple Bids: Mot Allowed

All Lines

Display:

- e Bi

Line Description

1 Structural firefighting gear (Jacket) Per Specification or Approved Equal

2 Structural firefighting gear (Pant) Per Specification or Approved Equal

d Required @Lme Comments/Files
20r2 00 Last
G
EA 300.0000
EA 300.0000

Status

Home | Add to Favorites

General event information

Event description and event
creator contact information

Line Items




3. When you click the ‘View Event Package’ link you will be brought to the ‘Event Header Comments and
Attachments’ page. Here you can view any attached documents the event creator has attached to the
event such as details and specifications etc. by clicking on the ‘View’ button. Click the ‘OK’ button to
return to the ‘Event Details’ page.

ngmes Han Menu > Manage Eveﬂl:i_r\d Plce Bids > View Events and Phce Bids

@ MNew Window [ Customize Page Ehttp

Event Header Comments and Attachments

Event I0: EVDOID0596

Comments:

THE PURCHASE OF THESE PRODUCTS WILL BE BASED UPON THE AVAILABILITY OF AN APPROPRIATION. THE AWARD OF A CONTRACT TO THE LY
WINNING BIDDER DOES NOT CONSTITUTE AN ORDER.  ANY OROERING WILL BE DONE BY THE CITY OF BOSTON ISSUING A PURCHASE

ORDER.

EID WILL BE AWARDED IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS

VENDOR MUST BID OMN ALL ITEMS.

Attached File Artachment Description
EVENT_586_-_DETAILS paf DETAILS View Jummm——
EV596_RE-AD_TERMS___ CONDITIONS. pof TERMS AMD CONDITIONS View

0K
' TiP:

If the document does not display it could be the pop-up blocker settings on
your PC. Click on your pop-up blocker message and select 'Allow Download'.
Another method is to press and HOLD your Control (Ctrl) key while clicking the
"Wiew' button. Give it a moment and the document should download .

4. When you are ready to begin entering your bid click on the ‘Bid On Event’ button

City of

Boston Home | AddtoFaverites

Favorites  Main Menu
Welcome, Paul McCormack Inc.

Event Details

User: PaullcCormack

Information On Inguiry Options Bidding Shortcuts: View Event Activity
| Accept Invitation | View Event Package
| Bid on Event ]

Event Name: BFD BUNKER GEAR

EventID: BOSTN-EV00002822

Event Format/Type: Sell Event RFx

Event Round: 1

Event Version: 1

Event Start Date: 12/28/2015 9:00AM EST

Event End Date: 01i12/2016 12:00 PM EST

Event Description:

BUNKER GEAR-STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING GEAR, JACKETS, PANTS per specificaion OR  APPROVED EQUAL
Contact: Lamberti Arlene Payment Terms: Met 30

Phone: 617 6253705 My Bids: 0

Email: Arlene.Lamberti@boston.gov Edits to Submitted Bids: Allowed

Online Discussion: Multiple Bids: Mot Allowed

Live Chat Help:
Display: All Lines - Y¥rBid Required Qune CommentsiFiles

Custormize | Find | view Al B | 8 First B 420f2 1 Last
N . ~ Requested
Line  Description Unit o antity Status
1 Structural firefighting gear (Jacket) Per Specification or Approved Equal EA 300.0000 b

2 Structural firefighting gear (Pant) Per Specification or Approved Equal EA 300.0000

Sign out




5. The system will ask you if you would like to have the bid quantity amounts automatically populated for
you with the same quantity that the City is requesting. Typically you would click ‘Yes’ here. You will still be
able to change these values on the next page if you need to.

City of ‘
Boston

Home | SupplerSepgont | AddloFavectes | Sonowt
Favorkes  Man Menu Manage Events and Phce Bids View Events and Place Bids

Detault he bid quantity

Ito the requested quantity? (18058.4118

Yes'if you would e 1o have the bid qu

Sel for 3uction line items def;
Quansty defaulted

¢ you. You will be allowed to change the line item bid quansity at any point prior to submitting your bid. Select No' if you do not wish to have the bid

One important note: if you select 1o default the did quanity, only non-group lines will be impacted by this oplion. This is because re: S for indnvidual fing items must be complele defore Dids can be placed for any kne groups
Yes No

i

6. You are now back on the ‘Event Details’ page however the page is no longer view only, you can now enter
information i.e. answer the required bid factor questions, enter bid amounts and add your own
documents as attachments if necessary. You will now see three new buttons; ‘Submit Bid’, ‘Save for
Later’, and ‘Validate Entries’. Their functions are described below:

e Validate Entries: This will check your bid response and alert you if there are any errors on your
bid submission prior to submitting it.

e Save for Later: If you begin your bid response and decide you need to finish it at another time
and do not want to lose your work, you can click this button. *It is important to note that
‘Save for Later’ does not submit your bid to the City. You MUST click the ‘Submit Bid’ button
to send your bid.

o Important: If you submit a bid and re-access it prior to the deadline to view/edit
your bid response you MUST resubmit your bid by clicking the ‘Submit Bid’ button
again.

e Submit Bid: This will send your completed bid to the City of Boston. Similar to the
functionality in the ‘Validate Entries’ button, the system will alert you if you have not
responded to one of the required entries when you click this button.

You can also view any of the attachments that the event creator has provided to bidders by clicking on the
‘View/Add General Comments and Attachments’ link.



Favorites  Main Menu
@ New Window IZ Customize Page E http =
) Welcome, Paul McCormack Inc
Event Details User: PaullcCormack
| Submit Bid | Saveforlater | | Validate Entries E
Event Nal BFD BUNKER GEAR Bidding Instructions
Event ID: BOSTN-EV00002822 Bid ID: New
Event Fol ype: Sell Event RFx Bid Date:
Event Round: 1 Bid Currency: US Dollar
Event Version: 1
Event Start Date: 12/28/2015 9:00AM EST
Event End Date: 01/12/2016 12:00 PM EST
<: ViewlAdd General Comments and Attachments
Hide Additional Event Info
Description:
BUNKER GEAR-STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING GEAR; JACKETS, PANTS per specification OR ~ APPROVED EQUAL
Contact: Lamberti Arlene Payment Terms: Met 30
Phone: 617 6353705 Billing Location: Purchasing Department
Email: Arlene Lamberti@boston.gov Event Currency: Dollar
Online Discussion: Conversion Rate: 1.00000000
Edits to Submitted Bids: Allowed
Multiple Bids: Mot Allowed

(Scroll down)

There are two basic steps to placing your Bid. Step #1-‘Answer General Event Questions’ and Step #2 - ‘Enter Line
Bid Responses’. Step #1 - Answer Bid Event Questions

Fiw!tes uah_glmu ES ummntivmmom > View Events and Place Bids

Step 1: Answer General Event Questions 1
Thi event dminisiralor requests your responss o questions not Specific 1o any speciic item.

Ganeral Event Ouestons: a . -
Roquired Quosbons: 5 . Summary of bid questions and responses
Questions Responsed Too L]

Event Questions
 Bid Required G ke al Response Required

Please rendew the Delow iNSIrucBons. for responding to this bia

IF RESPONDING ONUINE THROUGH THE SUPPLIER PORTAL:

Flease answer he questions asked inthis bid evenl including any file aitachment uploads. Cedtain questicns will require an
SNIWEF IN DFEEM 10 SUDTHA FOUF IS PONSE, Whe OINET QUESTONS 318 CREONAl when ey Penain 1o Yeur CoOmpany, Some quesions
require a sEecific answed which will be identSied 10 you. You will Be wamed of s qualification if you answer with an unacceptatie
answar iar ko SubMission,

Prowice a price quobe Tor all requesied line items. In some cases, you may indicale sl you are dedining to bid on 3 certain line
fem by clicking the Ha Bid chackbox,

Aftor answaring the questions and lising your price guoles, you can dlick the Validale Enfries’ bution to check if you've propey
answared all requiremants, When there are no lﬂm_'ﬂubmrrwur official bid response,

— Instructions for responding to bid.
IF RESPOMNDING THROUGH A HARD-COPY PAPER PACKAGE:

Fiease answer all questions asked in this bid event, including inseming any requested fle atachments. Certain questions requine
an answe in coder 1 be considersd & valid response.

B sure to SNSwed &valy Guesion Balis labeled with the phidss "TRESPONSE REQUIRED: YES™ Some questions mday regquire a
Bpecihic answer whith will Be identified ta you. Those gueshions will be labeled a3 "MANDATORY RESPONSE REGANRED: YES"
Bid submissions musi include the mandabory response to be eligible for award.

Prowice 3 price quobe Tor all requesied line items. In seme cases, you may indicale B3l you are dedining fo B4d on 2 certain ling
flaem by cligheng the ™o BT checipon

9 BID EVENT AHD CONTRACT TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1 canfirm hat | have read, fully undersland, and agree o comply with all lerms and conditions thal are 3380ci31e4d with this bid
event and the eventual confract.

Toview he associated terms and conditions, soroll in the top ol the page, select the View Event Package hyperdink and dick the
View buslon fof the Event Details socument

Allrequired Bid Questions
have a red star on the top

4

Response: - View All Exgn i
sdeni | Agrea X




7. Many of the bid questions can be answered by selecting the appropriate answer from a Response drop-
down box as shown below. Others may require manual text entry or on occasion you may be required to
attach a file to respond to the question. Respond to all required questions.

% & BID EVENT AND CONTRACT TERMS AND CONDITIONS

| confirm that | have read, fully understand, and agree to comply with all terms and conditions that are associated with this bid
évenl and the eventual contract

Toviewthe associated terms and condiions, scroll to the top of the page, select the View Event Package hyperlink and click the
View button for the Event Delails document

Response: v — View All Event Attachment Files

\deal S —

1-1Agree
12100 Not Agree

Step #2 - Enter Line Bid Responses

8. Once you have responded to all of the required bid questions — scroll down to the line item(s) listed on
the bid event. This is where you will enter ‘Your Unit Bid Price’ for all the lines listed on the event.

Step 2: Enter Line Bid Responses

This event contains one or more individual lines that await your bid response. Some or all lines may require your bid in order for consideration oy the
Event Administrator.

Lines in This Event: 2
Lines Responded To: 0
Your Total Line Pricing: 0.000000 USD

Hide Line Detail

¥ Bid Required (ZLine Comments/Files
Customize | Bl First Previous Lines 1-2 of 2 Next Lines
N L N Requested  Your Bid Your Unit Bid " Your Total Bid
Line  IltemID Description Unit Quantity Quantity Price No Bid Price
Structural firefighting gear
1 (Jacket) Per Specification  EA 300.0000| 200.0000 0.000000USD  Bid (@
or Approved Equal
Structural firefighting gear
2 (Pant) Per Specification or | EA 300.0000| 300.0000 0.000000USD  Bid o
Approved Equal

Atany pointin the bid response process you may save an in-progress bid and resume completion at later ime. When your bid response is complete, submit for
consideration

[ SubmitBid | Saveforlater | . Validale Enlries

Return to Event Search

m



There are several columns associated with each line item. See the screenshot below for an explanation of each.

Line

]

B
A . Requested Your Bid Your Unit Bid . Your Total Bid
Item ID Description Unit Quantity Quantity Fres No Bid e
Structural firefighting gear
1 (Jacket) Per Specification  EA 300.0000| 300.0000 0.000000 USD Bid Q
or Approved Equal
1 2 3 4 5 6 7

1.) Requested Quantity: (pre-populated). The number of units the City of Boston is requesting.

2.) Your Bid Quantity: (Required entry). The number of units you are willing to provide. (This value will
default in to the same number the City is requesting if you chose ‘Yes’ in step #6 above-you can edit as
necessary if required).

3.) Your Unit Bid Price: (Required entry). The price at which you can provide the item listed. You must

enter a unit bid price on every line you wish to bid on.

4.) No Bid: (Optional). If you do not wish to bid on a particular line item, you must check off the ‘No Bid’
box.

5.) Your Total Bid Price: (Auto populated). The Unit Bid Price entered multiplied by the bid quantity. This
is automatically calculated by the system. No entry is required here.

6.) ‘Bid’ link: (Optional entry). You do not have to click on this link on the majority of bid events however
some bid events may require you to input more detailed information about the line item such as
manufacturer and part number of the product you would supply to the City of Boston. If this is the case
the system would alert you by indicating that you were missing information on that line number when
you clicked the ‘Submit Bid’ or ‘Validate Entries’ buttons.

7.) Line Comment/Attachments: (Optional entry). Click here to add any comments or add any attachments

that are specific to that line item.
When all required fields are complete and you are ready to submit your bid response to The City of
Boston, click the ‘Submit Bid’ button.

or Approved Equal

Structural firefighting gear
(Pant) Per Specification or EA 300.0000| 300.0000 0.000000 USD Bid Q
Approved Equal

At any pointin the bid response process you may save an in-progress bid and resume completion at later time. When your bid response is complete, submit for
consideration.

Submit Bid Save for Later Walidate Entries

Return to Event Search



10. When you click ‘Submit Bid’ it may take a moment or two for the system to process your bid response.
Once it is successfully processed, you will receive a bid confirmation message confirming that your bid
was submitted. You will also receive an e-mail confirming your bid submission along with a .pdf copy of

your bid response.

wome | SupperSuppont | ssdw Favortes | Signowt

Favo.mes Man_Menu »  Manage E\J‘EHL?'EHG Place Bids > View Events and Place Bids

Bid Confirmation

Your bid has been successiully submitied

B newwindow (@ Help & customize Page [ nup

Bt 1D 1 Bid Date: 121192011 6:15:41PM EST
Ewvent 1ID: 0000000022 Dwraft Actuarial Services Request
Event Format: Sell Event Round: 1 Version: 1
Start Date: AZMS2011 T32AM PST End Date; 1273002011 09:20 AM
Your Total Price: 1,500,000,00 USD
DK
Done & Internet | Protected Mode: Off fa = HI10% -~

11. Bid/quote submission complete

If you have any questions or encounter any difficulty using the on-line Supplier Portal please e-mail us at
vendor.questions@cityofboston.gov or call us at 617-961-1058. Please give yourself ample time to familiarize
yourself with the supplier portal and get any support questions resolved well in advance of the deadline of your

bid.

Thank you for using the City of Boston supplier portal!


mailto:vendor.questions@cityofboston.gov

